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Dear Scientia Research Library editor

My name is Muhamad Asrar, Health Palytechnic Maluku, Indonesia
Would you please inform me further about :
1. My article title EFFICACY OF BISCUITS ENRICHED WITH BANANA SKY (Musa troglodyarium) TUNAAND FLOUR TUNA SKIPJACK AS A SUPPLEMENTARY FOOD +
FOR UNDERWEIGHT CHILDREN UNDER-FIVE YEARS IN AMBON was summited January 3 2020

2. s the topic of my paper suitable to your journal?
3. How long it takes to receive a decision by editor about my paper?

Thanks for your assistance.Looking forward to receiving any information about it.
Regards,
Muhamad Asrar,

Health Polytechnic Maluku, Indonesia
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Dear Author,
We would like to inform you that we have not received your manuscript Entitle :
EFFICACY OF BISCUITS ENRICHED WITH BANANA SKY (Musa troglodyarium) TUNA AND FLOUR TUNA SKIPJACK AS A SUPPLEMENTARY FOOD FOR UNDERWEIGHT
CHILDREN UNDER-FIVE YEARS IN AMBON was summited January 3 2020 e
]
. 2. Your topic is suitable for our Journal and can be publish in Journal of Applied Science and Research.

3. It takes 3-4 days for publication , our issue will be release in first week of March.

We also would like to inform your that if you would like to publish your manuscript we request you to submit your full article in word file. So that we ca send that
paper to our reviewers and once the reviewers accept for publication you need to make the payment of 120 USD as an APC fees.

Ck
|
= Regards

Managing Editor

Q SRL

m On Mon, Feb 24, 2020 at 12:04 AM info scientiaresearchlibrary <info@scientiaresearchlibrary.com> wrote:
No re Dear Managing Editor,

Start ¢ Please respond to this mail ASAP. >
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Dear Scientia Research Library Managing Editor,

Here | attach my article in ms word file
Hopefully get a good response and can be published immediately in the journals that you manage. e

Please, give me information as soon as possible. Thank you.

_l_
Regards,
Muhamad Asrar
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We are pleased to inform that our reviewers have recommended vour research work for publication and PLEASE SEND THE COPYRIGHT FORM COMPLETELY FILLED ALONG WITH SIGN ,A SCANNED COPY. So. we will provisionally

accepting your article for publication in issue of Journal of Applied Science And Research. You manuscript Id is JASR-2020-8-1-405 for :

EFFICACY OF BISCUITS ENRICHED WITH BANANA SKY (Musa troglodvarium) AND FLOUR TUNA SKIP JACK AS A SUPPLEMENTARY FOOD FOR UNDERWEIGHT CHILDREN UNDER-FIVE YEARS IN AMBON

Please read your article carefully. if having any changes. inform us (after publication of article no correction or amendment will be entertained) We will send you your article after making some necessary changes Before publishing we send you final copy for
making changes if you want _ after publish no changes can be made Language of Our journal is English only.

‘We are now on facebook too please like our page there.And forward the information regarding our journals to your known researchers and students.Please forward the attache file to your known researchers and students.

You can motivate your friends and known researchers to publish there research work in our journal.

We advise you to make the payment of 120 USD for Volume 8 Issue 1 ( NOTE Transfer Charge Excluding ) as a APC fees for publishing a paper ASAP.We request you to join our Whats app group. Please send us a message on

our whats app number +91 9538798040 your name and country name for regular updates on our Journals.

Through Bank Transfer:

Swift Code: ICICINBBCTS

MICR Code: 206229002

Beneficiary account name: Scientia Research Library

Beneficiary account Number: 081105500232

Bank name & address: ICICI Bank Limited, Etawah Branch,166 Chouragi,New Colony,Kacheri
Road,Etawah-206001, India

IFSC Code :ICIC0000811

PURPOQSE CODE : P0802 (DATABASE AND DATA PROCESSING CHARGES)

(please send a scan copy of bank transaction (swift copy) )

‘We look forward for your next manuscript in future.
Thank you in advance and we look forward for your next manuscript in future.
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Dear Scientia Research Library editor

Please send managing editor address

Thank you

Regards,
Muhammad Asrar
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submit scientiaresearchlibrary <submit.scientiaresearchlibrary@gmail.com>
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Dear author,

Please use below address

Scientia research library
857-A, harsh nagar
Etawah (Uttar Pradesh)
India

Pin 206001

Regards
Managing Editor
SRL
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Dear Scientia Research Library Managing Editor,
| have paid 120 US$ for manuscript handling charges

Herewith | attached the receipt of the payment

Regards
Muhamad Asrar
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Dear Scientia Research Library Managing Editor,

| have paid 120 US$ for manuscript handling charges
Herewith | attached the receipt of the payment

Thanks for your assistance.Locking forward to receiving any information about it.

Regards
Muhamad Asrar
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Dear Author ,

Please find the final copy for proof reading .

Please read it carefully in case you need to make any changes in final copy , please let us know . We will do it.
Please share the information of our Journal with your known researchers and students.

We look forward to hearing from you and for your upcoming manuscripts.

Regards
Managing Editor
SRL
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Dear Scientia Research Library Managing Editor,
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°
. It's a pleasure to be notified that my article will be published soon

v There are no changes in my article. Thank you

Regards
Muhamad Asrar
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KOMISI ETIK PENELITIAN KESEHATAN
HEALTH RESEARCH ETHICS COMMITTEE
POLTEKKES KEMENKES MALUKU

KETERANGAN LAYAK ETIK
DESCRIPTION OF ETHICAL APPROVAL
"ETHICAL APPROVAL"

Nomor: LB.02.01/6.2/3028/2019

>rotokol Penelitian Yang Diusulkan Oleh
The Research Protocol Proposed By

Peneliti Utama : Muhammad Asrar, S.KM., M.PH
Principal In Investigator

Nama Institusi : Poltekkes Kemenkes Maluku
Name of the Institution

Dengan Judul
Title

"EFIKASI PEMBERIAN MAKANAN TAMBAHAN BISKUIT YANG DIPERKAYA
PISANG TONGKA LANGIT DAN IKAN CAKALANG TERHADAP STATUS GIZI

DAN IMUNITAS BALITA (2-5 TAHUN) BERAT BADAN RENDAH"

Dinyatakan layak etik sesuai 7 (tujuh) Standar WI-!O ?011, yaitu 1) Nilai Sosial, 2) Nilai Ilmiah, 3) Pemerataan
Beban dan Manfaat, 4) Risiko, 5) Bujukan/Eksploitasi, 6) Kerahasiaan dan Privacy, dan 7) Persetujuan Setelah

Penjelasan, yang merujuk pada Pedoman CIOMS 2016. Hal ini seperti yang ditunjukkan oleh Grpeaniiingn
indikator setiap standar.

Declared to be ethically appropriate in accordance to 7 (seven) WHO 201 | Standards, 1) Social Values, 2 )
Scientific Values, 3) Equitable Assessment and Benefits, 4) Risks, 5) Persuasion/Exploitation, 6) Cor

‘ fidentiality
and Privacy, and 7) Informed Concent, referring to the 2016 CIOMS Guidelines. This is as indicare
Sulfillment of the indicators of each standard.

d by the

Prmyseat Laik Etik ini berlaku selama kurun waktu tanggal 07 Mei 2019 sampai dengan tanggal 07 Mei 2020
This declaration ©,

ethics applies during the period May 07, 2019 until » tay 07, '2020

May 07, 2019

——

Nurlaila Man‘eubessy,S.KM., M.MedEd







